
LIMESTONE 
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY 

BID TABULATION 
March 6, 2024 

 

                         Bidder 
Material Size          

National Lime & 
Stone 

Kimble Company 
Stocker 

Concrete Co 

Sidwell Materials 
dba Uniontown 

Stone 

Plant Location Tusky Dover 
Gnadenhutten & 
Newcomerstown 

St. Clairsville 

No. 1 or 2 26.55 23.25 39.00 13.70 

No. 4 26.55 23.25 39.00 13.90 

No. 8 No Bid 22.00 45.00 13.95 

No. 8 Western (white) 28.75 29.60 No Bid No Bid 

No. 57 No Bid 25.50 39.00 17.80 

No. 57 Western (white) 27.50 26.25 No Bid No Bid 

No. 67 Western (white) 29.50 27.25 No Bid No Bid 

No. 304 No Bid 22.00 39.00 13.65 

No. 304 Western 
(white) 

26.55 24.00 No Bid No Bid 

No. 411 26.55 22.00 No Bid No Bid 

Rip Rap Limestone 
Type A, B, C or D 

45.00 37.00 No Bid 24.45 

Rip Rap Sandrock 
Type A, B, C or D 

No Bid 37.00 No Bid No Bid 

Sandrock Type 0-2 No Bid 8.25 No Bid No Bid 

Surcharge for Delivery 
– New Phila Yard & 
North locations 

4.00 
White Stone  1.50 
Kimble Gray  3.00 

No Bid No Bid 

Surcharge for Delivery 
– Port Washington 
Yard & South locations 

4.50 
White Stone  3.00 
Kimble Gray  5.00 

No Bid No Bid 

 
 
Award to All Bidders 


