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March 2, 2022
Agenda

Lord’s Prayer
Pledge of Allegiance

1:15 p.m. DD Awareness Proclamation — TUSCBDD — Kerri Silverthorn
1:30 p.m. Bid Opening — Materials — Martha Campbell, Office Manager — Engineer’s Office

Approve Minutes
Approve Before/After Expenditures
Approve Supplemental Appropriation (2)
Approve Transfer of Funds (1)
Declare Obsolete — Veterans Service Office — Printer
Approve Dog & Kennel Report — February 2022
Authorize Advertisement — ARPA Technical Assistant Professional Consultant
Approve 2022 Technical Assistance Agreement - OECC
Pay Bills
Other Business

Adjourn

THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF TUSCARAWAS COUNTY MET IN REGULAR SESSION,

WEDNESDAY, THE 2ND DAY OF MARCH, 2022 WITH THE FOLLOWING MEMBERS
PRESENT:

Chris Abbuhl
Kerry Metzger
Al Landis
Commissioner Chris Abbuhl Presiding.
The Lord’s Prayer was said.
The Pledge of Allegiance was said.
RESOLUTION (174-2022) APPROVE MINUTES

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to approve the minutes of

the previous meeting as written.

VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

RESOLUTION (175-2022) BEFORE/AFTER EXPENDITURES

It was moved by Commissioner Landis, seconded by Commissioner Metzger, to approve the following

before/after expenditures:

VENDOR OFFICE AMOUNT
MNJ Technologies Auditor’s Office $660.00
BA Widder Architectural Services Commissioners $21,918.77
USA Label Express Dog Pound $152.00
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YOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

RESOLUTION (176-2022) SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRIATIONS

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to approve the following
supplemental appropriations:

DEPARTMENT |[FROM  [TO | AMOUNT |REAsON

Auditor’s Office | A018-A00 A001-HO1 $32,088.00 | To pay for the
2021 audit
examination

Road & Bridge | K000-K40 K000-K22 $2.837.00 | Workers
Compensation

VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

RESOLUTION (177-2022) TRANSFER OF FUNDS

It was moved by Commissioner Landis, seconded by Commissioner Metzger, to approve the following
transfer of funds:

DEPARTMENT | FROM TO AMOUNT REASON
Tax Map Office | A012-A04 A012-A12 $201.74 Workers
Compensation
VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

RESOLUTION (178-2022) OBSOLETE PROPERTY — VETERANS SERVICE OFFICE —
PRINTER

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to declare, as obsolete for
the use for which it was acquired in accordance to Ohio Revised Code 307.12 (B).

- Cannon P200 - DHII — dysfunctional
The items will be disposed of in accordance to ORC.
VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;
RESOLUTION (179-2022) DOG & KENNEL REPORT - FEBRUARY 2022

It was moved by Commissioner Landis, seconded by Commissioner Metzger, to approve the Dog &
Kennel Report for January, 2022 as submitted by Elizabeth Lewis, Facility & Adoption Specialist:



COMMISSIONER'S JOURNAL 84 3/2/22

DOG & KENNEL MONTHLY REPORT ' -

February 2022

1) Total dogs picked up by Wardens (a+b) 27
a. Owner requested pick up 1
b. Strays picked up by Wardens 26
2) Strays brought in by public 5
3) Dogs brought to pound by owners 14
4) Total dogs to Pound (1+2+3) 46
5) Dogs adopted 2
6) Dogs redeemed by owners 15
7)  Number of dogs euthanized 530,208
8) Released to rescues 24
a. Pull fees _$ 200
9) Pound fees _$ 668
10) Pick up fees _8 455
11)  License fees _$ 448
12)  Licenses sold on the road by Wardens 0
13)  Licenses sold at the Pound 15
14)  Complaints handled 50
15)  Citations issued 1
16)  Animal claims 0
17)  Mileage on trucks Fi50 2021  Truck #1 1314
Fi50 2017 Truck #2 1789.3
Total 3103.3
Submitted by:_Elizabeth Lewis
Euthanasia Key
Q = Quarantine PD = Pound Dog

OS = Owner Surrendered (either for health or aggression)

VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

RESOLUTION (180-2022) AUTHORIZE ADVERTISE RFQ - AMERICAN RESCUE PLAN
ACT TECHINICAL ASSISTANT PROFESSIONAL CONSULTANT

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to authorize the
advertisement for Request for Qualifications for the American Rescue Plan Act Technical Assistant
Professional Consultant as follows:

REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS
American Rescue Plan Act Technical Assistant Professional Consultant

The Tuscarawas County Board of Commissioners hereby issues a public Request for Qualification (RFQ)
for legal/technical professional services relating to the American Rescue Plan Act of 2021 (ARPA).

The qualified legal professional shall exhibit the following:

© Comprehensive understanding of the ARPA as it relates to Ohio County governments and the
Final Rule and be able to assist with:
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0 Determining project eligibility

0 Reporting requirements

0 Federal Treasury Uniform Administrative Requirements
0 Contracts with potential ARPA fund subrecipients

The successful legal professional shall be available from 8:00 am — 4:30 pm Monday — Friday to provide
technical assistance to Tuscarawas County. This may be in the form of telephone, email or virtual
meetings. The contract will terminate no later than December 2026. Selected firm will need to be
available for any audit questions/information in calendar year 2027.

The complete Request for Qualifications package may be obtained by contacting Scott Reynolds,
Director, Office of Community & Economic Development:

(330) 365-3219 or Economic & Community Development Office TUSCOC ED@co.tuscarawas.oh.us

Information concerning this Request for Qualifications is also available at:

https://www.co.tuscarawas.oh.us

Statements of Qualifications are due by noon on March 21, 2022.
By order of the Tuscarawas County Board of Commissioners:

125 E. High Avenue

New Philadelphia OH 44663

March 7 2022

Discussion: Commissioner Landis commented that getting professional help for ARPA clarification is
the right thing to do in order 1o get it right the first time and not have to circle back or give any money
back years down the road. Commissioner Metzger thinks the move is appropriate af this time because
when the ARPA funds were first released, the rules were hard to understand, and there are still changes
being made to the rules. A consultant will be a good thing to be able to get advice and direction on how
to move forward with some of the projects being considered. Commissioner Abbuhl noted the
Commissioners have reached out to CCAO to get some guidance on some of the organizations that have
expertise in the ARPA field. Commissioner Landis added when it is federal money, the county has to be
careful when it comes to the bid process because just about everything is going to touch the ARPA funds
and it is up to the Commissioners to make sure the funds are engaged properly as well as the
people/department who are participating in the program and receiving monies. Commissioner Metzger
clarified that ARPA Funds can be used for consultants and ARPA will fund this consultant.

VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

Discussion: Jesse Rothacher, Park Manager, stated this resolution is an amendment 1o a pre-existing
Technical Assistance Agreement with the Ohio & Erie Canalway Coalition (OECC) that the
Commissioners had entered into previously. The monies for this agreement was approved during the
2022 budgeting process and there is purchase order existing for this agreement. The OECC has provided
the Park Department with a great deal of help and assistance over the years relating to our mission and
goal of completing the Ohio & Erie Canalway Towpath Trail in Tuscarawas County. Commissioner
Abbuhl added with Dan Rice and the OECC partnering with the county, we all have been very fortunate
to have someone who has such in depth knowledge of the trail systems, understands how it works and how
Sfunding mechanisms work. Commissioner Metzger stated the relationship between Dan Rice at EOCC
has been so beneficial from where we started, and where we are today, it is night and day.

RESOLUTION (181-2022) 2022 TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT WITH THE OHIO
& ERIE CANALWAY COALITION (OECC)

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, and seconded by Commissioner Landis, to approve the 2022
Amendment to the Technical Assistance Agreement between the OECC and the Tuscarawas County
Commissioners for one additional year for $12,500 to accomplish the following:
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2022 Amendment to the
Technical Assistance Agreement
Between
Ohio & Erie Canalway Coalition
and
Tuscarawas County Commissioners

Amend the Technical Assistant Agreement to extend the Agreement for one (1)
additional year for $12,500 to accomplish the following:

Provide technical assistance and support to the Tuscarawas County Park
Department and the Advisory Committee.

Provide technical assistance and support to the Trail Projects identified in
the Tuscarawas County Trail and Green Space Plan, including the
McDonnell Trail Connection, Panhandle Passage, Ohio & FErie Canal
Towpath Trail, Zeisberger Trails and Parks, Buckhorn Creek Trail, Dover
Canal Park, Trenton Heritage Park, Roswell Trail, City of Dover Towpath
Trail and New Philadelphia Towpath Trail.

Provide leadership and technical assistance support for the Tuscarawas
County Park Advisory Committee, including facilitating meetings with the
partners, public involvement, coordinating project management and
fundraising.

Assist with the city of New Philadelphia Bicycle and Pedestrian
Connectivity Plan,

Coordinate the development of the Buckhom Creek Trail and work with
the volunteers assisting with the development of this project.

Coordinate the implementation of the Tuscarawas County Trail Plan
update and provide technical assistance to community partners.

Coordinate and supervise volunteers working on trail projects.

Coordinate the development of the Kimble Towpath Trail connection
between: a) Zoarville and State Route 416; and b) State Route 416 and
Dover

Assist the City of Dover regarding the development of the Qhio & Erie
Canal Towpath Trail.

Assist the City of New Philadelphia regarding the development of the
Ohio & Erie Canal Towpath Trail.

Assist with fundraising for the Trail Projects.

Coordinate the presentations regarding the update to the Tuscarawas
County Trail and Green Space Plan to the units of government as needed.

This resolution authorizes the President or Vice President of the Board of Commissioners to execute the

agreement.

VOTE:

Chris Abbuhl, yes;

Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

RESOLUTION (182-2022)

PAY BILLS

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to approve payment for the

following bills:
Meeting Date 03/02/2022

Auditor

Harris Computer Systems Support Services $2,646.82
Clerk of Courts

Graphic Enterprises Service $568.10
Frontier Service $53.98
Proforma Supplies $675.00
Great Lakes Computer Corp Maintenance $160.00
Commissioners

G & L Supply Supplies $682.42
Office Depot Supplies $24.45
US Postal Service Business Reply Mail Maintenance $800.00
BA Widder Architects Architect Services $21,918.77
Frontier Service $222.42
Kayline Supplies $505.86
Jimmy Hitchcock Humane Agent Salary/Feb 2022 $500.00
EODA Membership $200.00
Independent Elevator Elevator Service (2) $522.00
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$2,646.82

$1,457.08
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Fenton Brothers

Office Depot

Dominion Energy

Sherwin Williams

Hall Public Safety

Brandywine Valley Development

Common Pleas
Blooms Printing
Interpreters XP

Community & Economic
Development
Tusc Metropolitan Housing Authority

Community Corrections
First Communications
Verizon Wireless

Ohio AMS 6479

Coroner
Cuyahoga County Medical Examiner

Dog Pound

American Electric Power
Scott’s Lawn Care

USA Label Express

Total First Aid

Verizon Wireless

Engineer

Jim’s Towing Service

H & M Collision

Ziegler Bolt & Nut House
Jim’s Towing Service
Dynamic Hydraulic Services
Triple R Trailer

Young Truck Sales

Ace Truck Equipment
John W Cookson Co
Cross Truck Equipment
Dover Brake
Southeastern Equipment Co
Lacal Equipment

Snyder Brothers

John Deere

Custom Products Corp
Terminal Supply

Flynn’s Tire

Dominion Energy

Smith Concrete

Cargill Inc

Ohio Machinery

Zashin & Rich

Information Technology
MNJ Technologies

3/2/22

Supplies

Supplies

Service

Supplies

New Cruiser Equipment
Royalty Sharing

Business Cards & Envelopes
Interpreter

Tenant Based Rental Assistance

Long Distance
Cell Phone Service
Drug Testing Services

Autopsy

Service

Plow & Salt Services

Uniform T-Shirts & Sweatshirts
Supplies

Service

Towing

Repairs

Bridge & Culvert Supplies
Towing
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Repairs/Parts
Sign & Supplies per quote
Repairs/Parts
Tires & Repairs
Gas Service
Concrete per bid
Salt per bid
Repairs/Parts
Legal Services

RAM

$108.23
$18.69
$1,841.65
$53.47
$35,992.26
$166.25

$218.00
$574.40

$3,905.00

$33.97
$325.76
$100.00

$1,475.00

$608.59
$305.00
$152.00
$62.45
$35.10

$400.00
$5,683.20
$69.54
$400.00
$475.44
$390.60
$283.12
$5,257.17
$245.49
$18.42
$3,560.20
$900.00
$2,076.72
$88.35
$798.48
$1,667.01
$55.35
$938.28
$2,727.87
$5,244.00
$33,082.75
$1,649.66
$773.30

$140.00

$63,556.47

$792.40

$3,905.00

$459.73

$1,475.00

$1,163.14

$66,784.95



COMMISSIONER'S JOURNAL 84

3/2/22

OARnet Internet Connection $87.00
Great Lakes Computer Corp Server Maintenance $3,084.00
Pioneer 360 Internet/Support $75.00
$3,386.00
Job & Family Services
Mark Abbubhl et al AA & SAMS $18,600.85
Menards Maintenance Supplies $91.77
Midland Brightwood Keys $104.00
Amazon Supplies $280.62
T & T First Aid Supplies $47.16
Dominion Energy PRC/Gas $88.71
Wells Fargo Auto PRC/Car Payment $296.91
American Electric Power PRC/Electric $245.38
First Choice Pest Management PRC/Pest Control $150.00
Tusc Co Water & Sewer Pump Station Maintenance $150.00
Kiser Auto Repair & Fabricating Snow Removal & Salt $3,625.00
Telelanguage Inc Interpreter $518.49
Guidestone Ohio Start $2,523.64
Charter Communications Wireless Internet $157.49
Verizon Wireless Surface Pro Data $435.18
Enterprise FM Trust Fleet Payment $4,603.48
Horizons of Tusc & Carroll Transportation $10,308.42
Society for Equal Access Transportation $40,444.29
$82,671.39
Juvenile/Probate
Verizon Cell Phone Service $146.58
Interpreter XP interpreter $994.40
Johnson Printing Supplies $390.00
Uline Supplies $352.49
Staples Supplies $295.43
Staples Supplies $198.84
$2,377.74
Treasurer
Harris Computer Systems Software Support $580.28
$580.28
GRAND TOTAL $231,256.00

VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;

Kerry Metzger, yes;

Al Landis, yes;

Discussion: Kerri Silverthorn, Community Relations/Special Projects Director, Lisa Sidoti, Executive
Administrative Director, Chris Sapp, Community Connections Specialist and Nate Kamban,
Superintendent, all of Tuscarawas County Board of Developmental Disabilities (TUSCBDD) along with
Cassie Elvin, CEQ of Starlight Enterprises, Inc., Jeff Ott, Gordon Gerber and Eric Lingo, also from
Starlight Enterprises, Inc. were all present for the reading of the Proclamation for Developmental
Disabilities Awareness Month. Nate Kamban started by thanking the Commissioners for all of their

support of the TUSCBDD programs over the years. Ms. Silverthorn thanked the commissioners for being
Judges for the 2022 Better Together Awards, and highlighted some things TUSCBDD is doing this month,
like going around the county to all of the first-grade classes and donating a book about acceptance and
also reading it to the classes that have asked for it to be read. The books are being donated to TUSBDD
through a partership with The Autism Society of Ohio. Also happening this month, is a celebration of all
of the Direct Support Professionals (DSP) and Chris Sapp will be taking donuts around to all of the
DSP’s this month to let them know how much TUSCBDD appreciates what they do for people with
disabilities. On March 23, 2022, there will be a drive through parade at the TUSCBDD Campus from 12
p.m. -2 pm.

Cassie Elvin thanked the Commissioners for all of their support. Commissioner Abbuhl read the
Sfollowing proclamation:
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RESOLUTION (183-2022)
PROCLAMATION - DEVELOPMENTAL DISABILITIES AWARENESS MONTH - MARCH, 2022

It was moved by Commissioner Landis, seconded by Commissioner Metzger, to approve the following
resolution proclaiming March, 2022 as Developmental Disabilities Awareness Month.

PROCLAMATION
DEVELOPMENTAL DISABILITIES AWARENESS MONTH

MARCH, 2022

WHEREAS Ohio’s county boards of developmental disabilities were established by the Ohio General
Assembly on October 25, 1967; and

WHEREAS the mission and purpose of Ohio’s county boards of DD remain as strong as ever, with
county boards continuing to provide vital supports and resources to Ohioans with developmental
disabilities and their families; and,

WHEREAS the approximately 600 people with developmental disabilities served by the Tuscarawas
County Board of Developmental Disabilitics, their families, friends, neighbors, and co-workers encourage
everyone to focus on the abilities of all people; and

WHEREAS the most effective way to increase this awareness is through everyone’s active participation
in community activities and the openness to learn and acknowledge each individual’s contribution and to
recognize a community that is better together; and

WHEREAS policies must be developed, attitudes shaped, and opportunities offered that allow people
with developmental disabilities to live as independently and productively as possible in our community;
and

WHEREAS we encourage all citizens to foster and support such opportunities that include full access to
education, housing, employment, and recreational activities; and

Now, therefore, we, The Tuscarawas County Commissioners, do hereby proclaim March, 2022 as

DEVELOPMENTAL DISABILITIES AWARENESS MONTH

and offer full support to efforts that assist people with disabilities to make choices that enable them to live
successful lives and realize their potential: and

Furthermore, we urge all citizens to join in this celebration by spreading awareness of the many

contributions offered b ple with developmental disabilities in our community that is better together.
L]
-x

Kerry Metzger: —

Al Landis: ﬁ( Gnolee

Discussion: Commissioner Metzger thanked everyone present for all they do for people with
developmental disabilities. The program has come a long way since My. Metzger first started in 2003.
Mr. Metzger thinks progress is being made even though we are not where we need to be, the staff at
TUSCBDD and Starlight have done a great job. Mr. Metzger used to do the dental exams at Starlight for
about 10 years. Commissioner Abbuhl let everyone know they were welcome to come back and visit
anytime. Commissioner Landis said thank you for your love and care of this very special community.

VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;
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ADVISEMENT - BIDS - MATERIAL - ENGINEER

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to take

under consideration and advisement the following bids for various materials as opened

and read aloud by Martha Campbell, Engineer’s Office.

ASPHALT CONCRETE MAINTENANCE MATERIAL

ALL PRICES FOB PLANT/TON

COMPANY 301 402 404
Mar-Zane, Inc. 53.00 56.00 61.50
Newton Asphalt 60.00 62.00 67.00
Canton Asphalt Company 52.50 55.50 63.00
BITUMINOUS ASPHALT MATERIALS
Bidders CRS -2 HFRS-2 HFRS-2P Pe"g;%‘““ E;lgl Mobilization
FoB | FOB | rop | FOB | pop | FOB | pop | FOB | p;
Tusc Tusc Tusc Tusc Lump sum
Plant Plant Plant Plant ton
Co Co Co Co
Asphalt 1
; 210 (2235 2.10 {2235 240 | 2535 3.4 [3.535]1.50 900.00
Materials, Inc.
el 2.145 | 2275 | 2.145 | 2275 | 2.435 | 2.565 | 3.52 | 3.65 [ 9.00 | 1,500.00
Standard/JASA | < : ' ' St ' ' ' S0
GAS & FUEL OIL BID MARGINS
Winter Fuel New Philadelphia Port Washington Dundee
Company Additive for diesel fuel — | Unleaded # 2 Diesel (2) | Unleaded | #2 Diesel | #2 Diesel
price per gallon 550 gal 2000 gal 300 gal 2000 gal 300 gal
World Kinect
ExigreyLyikin Bty .02 .095 095 095 095 095
RJ Wright and Sons .023 .098 .098 .098 .098 .098
Wilkshire Treatment Plant County Jail City of Uhrichsville
Siphpany Unleaded 2000 | #2 Diesel 500 | Unleaded 2000 Unleaded | #2 Diesel 500
gal gal gal 1000 gal gal
World Kinect Energy/Lykin
e 095 .095 .095 .095 .095
RJ Wright and Sons .098 098 .098 .098 .098

COMMISSIONER'S JOURNAL 84

3/2/22

272



COMMISSIONER'S JOURNAL 84 3/2/22

ICE CONTROL GRITS
Bidder FOB Plant/Ton FOB New Phila FOB Port Washington
Newton Asphalt 6.50 No Bid No Bid
Soehnlen Bros Sand & Gravel 3.60 No Bid No Bid
Stocker Sand & Gravel 12.50 No Bid No Bid
(S}i::i\::lll‘zl;terials/ Midvale Sand & 8.00 No Bid No Bid
(S}ilfiav::lll_hé?itflﬂsizilsé Midvale Sand & 5.50 No Bid No Bid
Phoenix Asphalt Company 6.50 13.50 20.50
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READY-MIX CONCRETE

Bidd cl Bid per CY Bid per CY Bid per CY Bid per CY
1ader S SE Quadrant SW Quadrant NE Quadrant NW Quadrant
5 ¥ bag mix 120.00 120.00 120.00 120.00
6 bag mix 123.00 123.00 123.00 123.00
Pleasant Valley 6 !4 bag mix 126.00 126.00 126.00 126.00
Ready Mix Add on charge for less than 5 yd 1-3 $75.00 1-3 $75.00 1-3 $75.00 1-3 $75.00
load 3-5 $50.00 3-5 $50.00 3-5 $50.00 3-5 $50.00
Class C-S(_)0.0 psiwith ¢ | 138.00 | e
superplasticizer
5 %2 bag mix 131.00 131.00 131.00 131.00
6 bag mix 134.00 134.00 134.00 134.00
6 2 bag mix 137.00 137.00 137.00 137.00
' 1-1.75 $125.00 | 1-1.75 $125.00 | 1-1.75 $125.00 | 1-1.75 $125.00
il Conerele. | 5 o charge for less than § vd | 2-2-75 $100.00 | 2-2.75 $100.00 | 2-2.75 $100.00 | 2-2.75 $100.00
loaid & Ye1 3.3.75 $75.00 3-3.75 $75.00 | 3-3.75 $75.00 | 3-3.75 $75.00
4-4.75 $50.00 | 4-4.75 $50.00 | 4-4.75 $50.00 | 4-4.75 $50.00
5-5.75 $25.00 | 5-5.75 $25.00 | 5-5.75 $25.00 | 5-5.75 $25.00
Class C-SQO_() psiwith | 14700 |
superplasticizer
5 %2 bag mix 131.00 135.00 142.50 144.50
6 bag mix 135.50 138.00 146.50 148.50
Stocker 6 2 bag mix 137.00 141.00 149.00 151.00
e t
oncrete iﬂ(\);ig on charge for less than 5 yd 75.00 75.00 95.00 9500
Class C-S(.)0.0 psiwith (o 155.00 | e
superplasticizer ]
NOTE: There were no bids received for Ashes.
VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;

Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

OTHER BUSINESS: Commissioner Abbuhl read the following statement.:

COMMISSIONERS TO LIGHT COURTHOUSE
FOR UKRAINE

New Philadelphia, OH — Look for a change in lighting at the Tuscarawas County Courthouse. The

courthouse will be illuminated in Blue & Yellow, the colors of the Ukrainian flag,

Saturday and Sunday to show solidarity and unification with the people of Ukraine.

The Commissioners would like to stress this is about the
that we stand with these people during this unprovoked a

this coming Friday,

people of Ukraine and it is extremely important
ttack on democracy.

Although this is a small gesture, know that our thoughts and prayers are with the people and families in

Ukraine that are severely affected by these attacks as they are fighting to resist the Russian invasion.

Commissioner Landis thanked the Commissioners

Jor being unanimous with the decision to show support

Jor Ukraine, it is a small token, but it is very important for our residents here in Tuscarawas County and
the U.S. to know we stand united against this empire. Commissioner Metzger stated things have been well
said and prayers go out to these families. Commissioner Abbuhl hopes this all gets resolved quickly.

RESOLUTION (185-2022) ADJOURN

It was moved by Commissioner Metzger, seconded by Commissioner Landis, to adjourn at 2:04 p.m. to
meet in Regular session Monday, the 7th day of March, 2022
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VOTE: Chris Abbuhl, yes;
Kerry Metzger, yes;
Al Landis, yes;

We hereby certify the above and foregoing to be a true and correct account of the proceedings as had by
and before us on the day and year first written above.

e o/

Chris Abbuhl
Kerry Mgtzper
Al Landis

Attest:

Clerk

Myﬁmm—/
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