

**SAND & GRAVEL
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY
BID TABULATION
March 2, 2022**

ALL PRICES FOB PLANT/TON

BIDDER	#8	#57	SAND	#617
Newton Asphalt	13.50	18.50	6.50	No Bid
Soehnlén Bro. Sand & Gravel	10.40	16.00	5.00	No Bid
Stocker Sand & Gravel	23.50	23.50	10.00	No Bid
Phoenix Asphalt Company	9.00	19.50	3.75	14.75
Oster Sand & Gravel	16.50	17.00	6.00	No Bid