

Bid Tabulation
Tuscarawas County
ICE CONTROL GRITS
March 8, 2017

Bidder	FOB Plant/Ton	FOB New Phila	FOB Port Washington
Sidwell Materials/Midvale S & G	4.60	No Bid	No Bid
Sidwell Materials/Midvale S & G	4.30 (grit sand)	No Bid	No Bid
Stocker S & G	7.00	No Bid	No Bid
Newton Asphalt	4.75	No Bid	No Bid
Shelly Materials	6.25	15.50	13.50
Tucson, Inc.	5.00	12.00	18.00
Soehnlén Brothers S & G	3.60	No Bid	No Bid
Razor Lake LLC	4.00	No Bid	No Bid
Clark Clay	4.00	No Bid	No Bid
Central Allied Enterprises, Inc.	5.00	13.50	17.50

*Awarded to All Bidders