TIRES
Tuscarawas County - Bid Tabulation
March 4, 2010

BIDDER Clum Tire
Price per tire Core credit Disposal fee
LT 235/85R-16 AT 80.45
LT 245/75R-16 AT 80.00
P265 70R 17 150.24
11R 22.5 Steer 231.00
11R 22.5 Drive 252.00
11R 24.5 Steer 308.25
11R 24.5 Drive 318.29
385 65R 22.5 Steer 330.00
315 80R 22.5 Steer 278.00
ST-225/75 R-15 No bid
12.4 R 24 (tractor) 440.49
12.0 x 16.5 (backhoe) 129.28
380 85R 28 (tractor) 650.23
18.4 x R30 (tractor) 876.88
19.5L-24 (backhoe) 508.32
480 85R 38 (tractor) 723.29
1400 x 24 402.42
18-22.5 No bid
9R 22.5 199.40
L285 75R 16 177.19
235 75R 17.5 239.70
215 75R 17.5 (18) trailer 224.49
215 75R 17.5 (16) trailer 205.80
9.5R 16.5 (10) trailer 86.40
22570 R 22.5 204.00
22570 19.5 162.00
Drive In Flat Re_pair '_I'andem and 2200
Dual Wheel Drive Tires Only
Roll In Flat Repair Tandem and 17.00
Lowboy
Roll In Flat Repair Pick-ups, Tractor
and Backhoe - Front Tires, trailer 12.00
tires, & brush chipper
Roll In Flat Repair Grader, Gradall
and Loader, Tractor and Backhoe No bid
rear tires
Road Service Call Equipment
(Grader/Loader/Gradall/Tractor — No bid
rear) Price per hour

NO BID AWARDED



